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ITEM Brand/ Model Unit Cost Each Unit Cost Each Unit Cost Each Unit Cost Each

Piccolo Pearl PFP-165 $1,023.00 $1,185.18 $1,076.84 No Bid

Piccolo Pearl PFP-105 Grenaditte $711.00 $798.59 $748.42 No Bid

Piccolo Yamaha YPC-62 No Bid $1,809.64 $1,562.00 No Bid

Piccolo Gemeinhardt Roy Seaman Storm $899.00 $1,024.86 No Bid No Bid

Oboe Yamaha YOB-441 Intermediate Grenadilla No Bid $3,258.97 $2,813.00 No Bid

Oboe Selmer Model 121 Intermediate $2,498.35 $2,894.43 $2,498.35 No Bid

Oboe Fox 333 $2,800.00 $3,081.70 No Bid No Bid

Bassoon Fox Renard 240 $9,100.00 $10,185.85 No Bid No Bid

Bassoon Fox Model IV $5,243.00 $6,074.20 No Bid No Bid

Bassoon Fox 41 $4,800.00 $5,320.00 No Bid No Bid

Bass Clarinet YCL 221 No Bid $2,049.45 $1,787.00 No Bid

Bass Clarinet Selmer 1430LP $1,762.84 $1,963.76 $1,762.84 No Bid

Bass Clarinet Buffet Crampon 1180 Student $4,894.00 $5,445.57 No Bid No Bid

Alto Saxophone YAS 480 No Bid $1,945.60 $1,801.00 No Bid

Alto Saxophone P. Muriat PMSA 57GC No Bid $1,140.77 No Bid No Bid

Tenor Saxophone YTS-480 No Bid $2,233.45 $2,607.00 No Bid

Tenor Saxophone P. Muriat PMST 56GC No Bid $1,543.16 No Bid No Bid

Tenor Saxophone Jupiter JTS 1100 $1,572.08 $1,787.41 $1,650.68 No Bid

Baritone Saxophone YBS-52 No Bid $5,006.03 $4,321.00 No Bid

Baritone Saxophone Eastman EBS640 Professional $2,050.00 No Bid $2,144.00 No Bid

Baritone Saxophone P. Muriat PMB-300 No Bid $5,804.39 No Bid No Bid

Baritone Saxophone Yamaha YBS-52 Intermediate Baritone Saxophone No Bid $5,006.03 $4,321.00 No Bid

Baritone Saxophone Jupiter JBS 1100 $3,569.58 $3,882.16 $3,748.06 No Bid

French Horn Yamaha YHR-671 - Fixed Bell No Bid $4,129.39 $3,642.00 No Bid

French Horn Holton 379 $2,597.36 $3,009.13 $2,597.36 No Bid

French Horn CONN 7D Geyer Series $2,597.36 $3,009.13 $2,597.36 No Bid

French Horn Holton H181 $3,571.07 $4,137.21 $3,571.07 No Bid

Trombone Bach 42B $2,631.30 $3,048.45 $2,631.30 No Bid

Bass Trombone Yamaha YBL 830 No Bid $4,630.73 $3,764.00 No Bid
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Bass Trombone Bach 50B2L $3,714.43 $4,303.30 $3,714.43 No Bid

Euphonium Yamaha YEP 642II No Bid $5,722.01 $4,939.00 No Bid

Euphonium YEP-321 No Bid $2,077.26 $1,793.00 No Bid

Euphonium Yamaha YEP-321S No Bid $2,342.56 $2,022.00 No Bid

Euphonium Eastman EEP 526 $2,550.00 $3,048.83 $2,674.41 No Bid

Euphonium King 2280 $1,853.12 $2,146.90 $1,853.12 No Bid

4/4 Tuba w/ case St Petersburg 203/450 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4/4 Tuba w/ case Eastman EBB534S $4,400.00 $5,254.90 $4,003.86 No Bid

3/4 Tuba w/ case Eastman EB226 $2,900.00 $3,455.03 $3,030.72 No Bid

3/4 Tuba w/ case Jupiter JTU1010 $3,420.83 $3,721.19 $3,591.87 No Bid

Sousaphone Yamaha YSH-411SWC (silver) No Bid $6,938.48 $7,067.00 No Bid

Sousaphone case- SKB-380 case with wheels No Bid $403.46 $556.00 No Bid

Bass Guitar and Stand Yamaha TRBX605FM Dark Red Burst $600.00 $546.29 $649.99 No Bid

Bass Amp Ampeg PF-201HE Portaflex 2x10 Bass Speaker Cabinet $330.00 $377.19 $449.99 No Bid

Electric Guitar and stand

Sterlink by Music Man Luke Flame Maple Top - Hazel 

Burst $540.00 $640.30 No Bid No Bid

Snare Drum w/ case Majestic Prophonic 14x6.5 Maple $667.06 No Bid $787.43 No Bid

Snare Drum Majestic 14x4 Concert Black Aluminum $555.88 $517.99 $585.14 No Bid

Snare Drum Yamaha YAM-CSM1465A No Bid No Bid $465.00 No Bid

Snare Drum Pearl Philharmonic PHP1465 $636.00 $625.88 $669.47 No Bid

Piccolo Snare Drum Pearl Piccolo snare PEA-M1330-102 $211.00 $272.65 $562.11 No Bid

Piccolo Snare Drum

Grover Pro Keegee Piccolo Snare Drum Natural 

Lacquer - 14x3 GRO-G2-3-N No Bid No Bid $405.75 No Bid

Snare drum stand 

Double braced Pearl S-1030L Concert Snare Drum Stand $132.00 $162.89 $189.95 No Bid

Snare drum stand 

Double braced Yamaha Concert Snare Stand (SS745) YAM-SS745 No Bid $96.61 $89.95 No Bid

Snare drum stand 

Double braced Yamaha SS740A $60.00 No Bid $74.99 No Bid

Snare Case

3x13 Humes & Berg Galaxy Snare Drum Bag-HUM-

GL422 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Snare Case

6.5x14 Humes & Berg Galaxy Snare Drum Bag-HUM-

GL478 No Bid $30.59 No Bid No Bid

Snare Sound projectors YAM-MSP-14 No Bid No Bid $24.00 No Bid



Chimes Adams 1.6 Oct Symphonic $4,857.00 $5,585.99 $5,112.63 No Bid

Chimes Adams 1.5 Oct GEN2 $3,332.00 $3,831.99 $3,507.37 No Bid

Chimes Musser 1.5 Symphonic Chimes Brass $5,008.00 $5,469.99 $5,008.00 No Bid

Drum Set Gretsch Catalina Club Jazz Shell Pack 18in BD $585.00 $554.32 $599.99 No Bid

Drum Set Pearl Export Standard 5 Piece Drum Set $516.00 $680.84 $899.99 No Bid

Drum Set

Gretsch Catalina Maple Groove Pack 5 Piece GRE-CM1-

E605 $665.00 No Bid $799.99 No Bid

Drum set Cymbals Pack Zildjian K Custom Dark Box Set $1,110.00 $742.80 $1,039.95 No Bid

Drum set Cymbals Pack Zildjian K Cymbal Pack ZIL-K0800 $1,050.00 $646.80 $979.95 No Bid

Marimba Majestic Reflection Series 5 Oct $12,500.00 $13,224.99 $13,157.89 No Bid

Marimba Adams 4.3 Concert Synthetic w Field Frame $4,157.00 $4,780.99 $4,375.79 No Bid

Xylophone Majestic MAJ-X8540H $3,312.50 $3,524.99 $3,506.58 No Bid

Xylophone Adams 3.5 octave Synthetic Bar Soloist Xylophone $2,448.00 No Bid $2,129.47 No Bid

Xylophone Yamaha YX-500R No Bid No Bid $3,190.00 No Bid

Bongos LP Matador $130.00 $132.55 $189.99 No Bid

Floor Bass drum Yamaha FB-9022 No Bid $756.65 $677.00 No Bid

Glockenspiel Malletech 2.6 Infinity w/ black case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Glockenspiel Yamaha 2.5 octave YG-1210 No Bid $1,039.99 $905.00 No Bid

Glockenspiel Cart Yamaha YAMYGS100 No Bid No Bid $90.67 No Bid

Glock stand Ludwig LE1368 $63.00 $71.99 $84.00 No Bid

Djembe Remo 14in key tuned $250.00 No Bid $299.00 No Bid

Djembe Remo 16in key tuned $300.00 No Bid $349.00 No Bid

Gong Zildjian 40in Chau $1,075.00 $1,002.05 $1,265.50 No Bid

Gong Zildjan P0501 $710.00 $667.41 $843.00 No Bid

Gong Stand w/ wheels Zildjan P0560 $125.00 $126.61 No Bid No Bid



Gong Cart Pageantry Innovations PAG GC-10 No Bid $748.80 $982.00 No Bid

Bass Drum w/ stand and 

cover Yamaha Grand Series 36in No Bid $2,778.47 $2,486.00 No Bid

Bass Drum w/ stand and 

cover Adams ADM-ABDS4022 $2,616.00 $3,006.90 $2,753.68 No Bid

Bass Drum Feild Frame Yamaha Tough Terrain No Bid $719.99 $594.00 No Bid

Timpani Yamaha Cambered Copper set of 5 TP8300 No Bid $19,514.99 $17,163.00 No Bid

Timpani

Set of 4 (23/26/29/32) - Yamaha Intermediate Series 

Smooth Copper Timpani YAM-TP6304CL No Bid N/A $11,504.00 No Bid

Timpani

Ludwig Standard Series Polished Copper with Gauge 

(23/26/29/32) $10,671.37 $12,188.71 $10,671.37 No Bid

Timpani

Adams Copper Hammered Professional Gen II 

(20/23/26/29/32) $15,372.00 $18,144.44 $17,189.47 No Bid

Cymbals Zildjian 18in K Constantinople Special Selection Pair $610.00 $484.25 $722.50 No Bid

Cymbals ZIL-A0447 $400.00 $301.95 $450.50 No Bid

Cymbals- Hand Cradle ZIL-TCC $75.00 No Bid $99.99 No Bid

Cymbal Stands Yamaha CS665A $65.00 $39.14 $59.99 No Bid

Crash Cym Stand Gibraltar 7614 $70.00 $44.01 $69.99 No Bid

Hi Hat Stand Yamaha HS740 $110.00 No Bid $119.99 No Bid

Hi Hats Zildjian K Sweet 14in $350.00 $281.69 $394.00 No Bid

Suspended Cymbal Zildjiain 20in K Constantinople $350.00 $280.16 $418.00 No Bid

Suspended Cymbal Zildjian 20in Sweet Crash $275.00 $242.24 No Bid No Bid

Suspended Cymbal Zildjian 19in Sweet Crash $275.00 $228.66 No Bid No Bid

Suspended Cymbal ZIL-K1012 $310.00 $242.29 $361.50 No Bid

Suspended Cymbal 

Stand Gibralter GIB-5709 $65.00 $60.35 $62.99 No Bid

Suspended Cymbal 

Cymbal Arm ZIL-TCA $45.00 $46.32 $59.99 No Bid

Splash Cym Zildjian 10in K Custom Dark $115.00 $96.88 $135.50 No Bid

Splash Cym Zildjian 8in K Custom Dark $105.00 $85.79 $120.00 No Bid



China Cymbal Weiss 18in No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

China Cymbal Weiss 14in No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Concert Toms w/ stands Yamaha Mid Range (10/12/13/14) No Bid $1,656.35 $972.00 No Bid

Concert Toms w/ stands Yamaha (15/16) No Bid $1,736.55 $570.00 No Bid

Concert Toms w/ stands Black Swamp BLA-CT1012CB (10-12) $1,030.00 $1,036.73 $1,160.00 No Bid

Concert Toms w/ stands Black Swamp BLA-CT1314CB (13-14) $1,075.00 $1,089.71 $1,219.00 No Bid

Tom Cases

Tuxedo Humes and Berg (10x9 10x12 11x13 11x14 

12x15 12x16) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Tom holders Yamaha CL940B No Bid No Bid $23.99 No Bid

Temple blocks Granite 

blocks LP LP1210 $165.00 $192.74 $229.99 No Bid

Temple Blocks w/ stand Grover No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Timbales w/stand LP Aspire $185.00 $198.89 $269.99 No Bid

Wind Chimes Double 

Row Treeworks-TRE35DB No Bid $179.99 $251.99 No Bid

Vibes Adams Concert Series 3/0 Octave w/endur frame $3,947.00 $4,539.99 $4,154.74 No Bid

Vibes Yamaha YV-520 3-Octave No Bid No Bid $4,220.00 No Bid

Field Drum Majestic 14x12 Limited Edition $788.82 No Bid $829.69 No Bid

Congas w/ stand LP Aspire $325.00 $400.30 $479.99 No Bid

Conga Quinto Matador LP-M750S-W $285.00 $316.49 $429.99 No Bid

Conga Tumbadora Matador LP-M752S-W $290.00 $323.67 $439.99 No Bid

Conga Stand Pearl PC2500 $73.00 $99.61 $104.99 No Bid

Crotales Hi Oct Zildjian High Octave $1,225.00 $1,245.30 $1,453.00 No Bid

Crotales Low Oct Zildjian Low Octave $1,225.00 $1,245.30 $1,453.00 No Bid

Crotales Mount High ZIL-P0637 $120.00 $119.56 $149.99 No Bid

Crotales Mount Low ZIL-P0636 $120.00 $119.56 $149.99 No Bid

Bar chimes TreeWorks Tre 35 No Bid $107.99 $128.99 No Bid



Chime mounting 

bracket Treeworks-TR52 No Bid $21.59 $26.99 No Bid

Clavinova w/ dolly, 

bench and cover CVP-701 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Clavinova w/ dolly, 

bench and cover CVP-809 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Baby Grand 4.5'-5' w/ 

dolly, cover w/ locking 

straps and bench Yamaha No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Drum Major/ Field 

Podium DSI 6 ft Command Center Podium DC582 Silver No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Drum Major/ Field 

Podium Jarvis Model 10 72 inch 36x36 platform No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Drum Major/ Field 

Podium DSI 52 inch Command Center No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Drum Major/ Field 

Podium DSI 42 inch Command Center No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Field PA system Anchor Audio Megavox 2 deluxe air package No Bid $2,230.20 $2,394.00 No Bid

Field Rack Titan TTN-MUFF6 No Bid $908.99 No Bid No Bid

16" Marching Bass 

Drum Cover Yamaha (blue) No Bid No Bid $56.00 No Bid

18" Marching Bass 

Drum Cover Yamaha (blue) No Bid No Bid $56.00 No Bid

20" Marching Bass 

Drum Cover Yamaha (blue) No Bid No Bid $56.00 No Bid

24" Marching Bass 

Drum Cover Yamaha (blue) No Bid No Bid $58.67 No Bid

28" Marching Bass 

Drum Cover Yamaha (blue) No Bid No Bid $62.67 No Bid

Marching Bass Drum 

16"/case/carrier/stand Yamaha Feild Corps "Natural Gloss" No Bid No Bid $946.00 No Bid

Marching Bass Drum 

18"/case/carrier/stand Yamaha Feild Corps "Natural Gloss" No Bid No Bid $1,002.00 No Bid

Marching Bass Drum 

20"/case/carrier/stand Yamaha Feild Corps "Natural Gloss" No Bid No Bid $1,032.00 No Bid

Marching Bass Drum 

24"/case/carrier/stand Yamaha Feild Corps "Natural Gloss" No Bid No Bid $1,163.00 No Bid

Marching Bass Drum 

28"/case/carrier/stand Yamaha Feild Corps "Natural Gloss" No Bid No Bid $1,297.00 No Bid

Marching Snare Cover Yamaha (blue) No Bid No Bid $44.00 No Bid

Marching Snare 

Drum/Case/Carrier/Stan

d Yamaha SFZ 14in "Natural Gloss/chrome hardware" No Bid No Bid $1,167.00 No Bid



Marching Tenors 6-10-

12-13-

14/case/carrier/stand Yamaha Feild Corps "Natural Gloss" No Bid No Bid $1,864.00 No Bid

Marching Tenors Cover

Yamaha Marching Tenor Rehearsal Cover 10,12,13,14 

(blue) No Bid No Bid $57.33 No Bid

Speaker Carts Pageantry Innovations SC-10 No Bid $855.00 $1,079.00 $1,199.00

Subwoofers Presonus StudioLive 18sAI $1,058.00 $1,259.95 $1,398.99 $1,893.52

Synth Yamaha MoxF8 No Bid $1,262.60 $1,999.99 No Bid

Synth Cart Pageantry Innovations PAG-KC-30 No Bid $2,034.00 $2,610.00 $2,350.00

Loudspeakers Presonus CDL12P $1,500.00 $948.64 $998.99 $921.36

piano with stand Williams Rhapsody 2 88-key Console Walnut No Bid $397.10 No Bid No Bid

Yamaha Harmony 

Director and stand HD-300 No Bid $540.00 $699.99 No Bid

Yamaha Harmony 

Director and stand HD-200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Yamaha Speaker Yamaha DBR10 Powered Speaker $240.00 $292.49 $299.99 $298.90

Bid Notes

As per the terms and conditions of B21-14, FCS has the option to place orders for the equipment above at quantities to be 

determined for Hendricks MS & East HS.  Not all equipment may be purchased due to FCS requested mutiple options in several 

product groups. The total estimated spend amount for both schools under this contract will be $240,000. 


